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MOMOIRO NIGORIZAKE (OTAKIJYO
大多喜城)

SKU: AT-215-JP-016

Designer: ADELINE YEO-
MATSUZAKI

Otaki is translated plainly as O (大)
meaning “large”, Ta (多) meaning
“many” and Ki (喜) meaning
“happiness”. Otakijyo with its imposing
Otaki castle is a witness to countless
victorious shogun battles since the
1500s. Surrounded by deep pine forests
and a graduation of mountains, the
Otaki castle hosts an annual festival
known as the “Oshiro Matsuri”, a lively
celebration filled with parades and
demonstrations by the local town folk.

Momoiro Nigorizake is a beautiful and
exquisite peach-pink cloudy sake that
appeals to a sweet palate. It is well-
balanced because of its acidity and
intensity. Delightful with spiced dishes
or to round off a rich meal. 

Label Art: "Victorious in Pink", by
Adeline Yeo-Matsuzaki
Inspired by the valiance of general
Honda Tadakatsu, the famed samurai
general who was believed to have never
lost a battle, the Japanese pavilion and
garden resplendent in pink blossoms
was what the artist Adeline imagined
the setting would be for celebrating a
shogunate battle victory in Otakijyo
centuries ago.

Dimensions: L25.5 x W34 x H33 cm

Primary Material: Beverages
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Primary Color: Pink
Customization: This product is not
customizable.


